
The Best Restaurants in St. Barts 
St. Barths, a jewel in the Caribbean, is renowned for its dazzling 
beaches, stunning landscapes, and, most notably, its exquisite dining 
scene. With a rich culinary heritage that marries French sophistication 
with Caribbean flair, this island paradise offers a gastronomic journey 
that is as diverse as it is delectable. This guide highlights the best 
restaurants in St. Barts, offering a curated selection of top dining spots 
that promise an unforgettable culinary experience on the island.


Le Sereno Al Mare Restaurant: A Haven for Italian 
Cuisine Lovers

Le Sereno Al Mare Restaurant has firmly established itself as one of the 
top waterfront eateries in St Barths. The restaurant’s contemporary 
Italian menu, exceptional service, and breathtaking ocean views make it 
a must-visit destination for foodies.


The restaurant adopts an open-air concept, allowing guests to enjoy 
stunning views of the Grand Cul de Sac from almost every angle. From 
dining on the beach to savoring a meal under the shade of coconut 
trees, the restaurant offers a range of dining experiences.


Signature Dishes

Le Sereno Al Mare Restaurant is renowned for its Spaghetti con 
Aragosta (lobster spaghetti) and Vitello tonnato. Don’t miss out on their 
homemade tiramisu – a delightful way to end your meal.


Bar Sereno

The Bar Sereno offers an extensive list of unique cocktails and fine 
wines. Overlooking the waters, it’s the perfect spot to unwind after a 
day of exploration.


https://hauteretreats.com/st-barts-holiday/
https://hauteretreats.com/caribbean-villa-rentals-and-luxury-resorts/
https://www.serenohotels.com/property/le-sereno/restaurant-in-st-barths/




Related 12 Best Things to Do in St Barts


Fouquet’s: A Taste of France in the Caribbean

Fouquet’s, a French brasserie, offers an impressive array of French 
dishes crafted by 3-star Michelin-star chef Pierre Gagnaire. The 
restaurant’s beautiful panoramic views of the bay of Gustiva further 
enhance the dining experience.


Interior and Ambience

The interior, designed by Gilles and Boissier, radiates casual elegance. 
Wicker furniture, soft materials, and Parisian styling create a relaxing 
environment. The menu boasts a range of dishes, from red tuna tataki 
and French cheese selections to beef filet with Osciètre caviar.


Le Fouquet’s Signature Cocktail

Start or end your evening on a high note with a signature cocktail from 
Le Fouquet.


https://hauteretreats.com/best-things-to-do-in-st-barts/


Gyp Sea: Where Bohemian Meets Luxe

Gyp Sea is a hangout spot that perfectly blends the Bohemian lifestyle 
with Caribbean luxe vibes. Located on Pelican Beach, the restaurant 
offers a range of Mediterranean dishes, with almost everything cooked 
on the barbecue.


Menu Highlights

The restaurant’s Beef Brisket Texas style and Carpaccio of grilled tuna, 
ginger, and sesame are crowd favorites. End your meal with a sweet 
treat – the roasted pineapples and sweet coconut sorbet are highly 
recommended.


Beachfront Dining

Gyp Sea offers beachfront dining with a lively atmosphere. The 
excellent bar offers a rare selection of rum, wines, and handcrafted 
cocktails.




Related 5 Amazing Beaches in St. Barts


https://www.gypsea-stbarth.com/
https://hauteretreats.com/5-amazing-beaches-st-barts/




Tamarin: A Tropical Garden Dining Experience

Situated near Saline Beach and nestled in a tropical garden, Tamarin is 
a paradise for food lovers. The restaurant offers a generous and 
creative menu, blending French cuisine with local delicacies.


Unique Ambience

Tamarin’s setting is truly unique. Dine among banana trees, lily ponds, 
and baby turtles, and enjoy the stunning views during your meal. The 
restaurant’s romantic setting, accentuated by subtle lanterns and pretty 
furnishings, makes it a perfect spot for a romantic dinner.


Signature Drinks

The drinks menu at Tamarin offers tastes from Asia and France. Enjoy 
signature cocktails and an extensive wine list featuring over 200 
vintages.






Related 12 Good Reasons to Visit St Barts


Bonito: A Blend of Comfort and Elegance

Since its inception in 2009, Bonito has become a popular dining spot in 
St Barths. The first-class restaurant offers a comfortable and relaxed 
environment, enhanced by a beautiful view of Gustavia Harbor.


Unique Interior

The interior of Bonito is designed to resemble a beach house, allowing 
guests to feel welcomed while enjoying unforgettable international 
cuisine.


Live Music

At Bonito, you can enjoy live music played by DJ Trujillo and DJ Alex 
Moretti. The relaxing tunes set the mood while you dine. Don’t miss out 
on their specialty cocktails and extensive wine and spirits list.


https://hauteretreats.com/reasons-to-visit-st-barts/




Black Ginger: Authentic Thai Cuisine

Black Ginger is an amazing Thai restaurant offering a selection of 
dishes crafted by the best Thai chefs from Bangkok. If you’re a fan of 
Thai food or looking to try something new, Black Ginger is the place to 
be.


Unique Dining Experience

Dine under the starry night sky in the stunning courtyard area. The 
restaurant features a sliding roof that closes when it rains – a unique 
feature that adds to the dining experience.


Signature Dishes

The Thai dishes at Black Ginger are crafted from fresh ingredients and 
spices. Make sure to try the Pork Ribs dipped in soy caramel and 
lemongrass or the Tofu Massaman curry.


https://blackgingersbh.com/




Eddy’s Ghetto: A Blend of French and Creole Cuisines

Tucked away in the heart of Gustavia, Eddy’s Ghetto serves up French 
dishes with a local twist. The restaurant’s relaxed atmosphere makes it 
a perfect spot to enjoy delicious Creole cuisine.


Unique Setting

At Eddy’s Ghetto, you’re surrounded by palm trees and beautiful 
wooden decor. The restaurant’s creative cocktails are a must-try.


Signature Dishes

From homemade tacos to wild prawns, there are plenty of dishes to 
choose from. Don’t forget to try Eddy’s homemade punch – a local 
favorite.






La Langouste: Lobster Lovers’ Paradise

La Langouste, located in the Baie Des Anges hotel, is known for serving 
the best lobster in St Barths. The restaurant offers authentic Creole 
cuisine.


Unique Dining Experience

Fish lovers will enjoy the unique dining experience at La Langouste. You 
can pick the lobster you want from the tank, and it will be grilled to your 
liking.


Beachfront Dining

The restaurant is located outdoors, allowing you to enjoy the views of 
Flamands Beach and the Caribbean Sea. It’s the perfect location for a 
relaxing walk along the beach after your meal.






Bonjour: A French Dining Experience

Bonjour offers an authentic French dining experience. The restaurant 
serves a variety of dishes, from homemade pasta to fresh seafood. The 
restaurant’s relaxed atmosphere makes it a perfect spot for a casual 
meal.


Signature Dishes

Don’t miss out on the restaurant’s signature dishes. The lobster 
spaghetti is a must-try.


Unique Setting

The restaurant’s unique setting, surrounded by lush greenery, adds to 
the dining experience. Make sure to book a table for a romantic dinner 
with your loved one.


Related St. Barts Calendar of Events


L’Isola: Italian Cuisine with a Twist

L’Isola offers an impressive array of Italian dishes crafted by top chefs. 
The restaurant’s beautiful panoramic views of the bay enhance the 
dining experience.


https://hauteretreats.com/st-barts-calendar-of-events/


Signature Dishes

L’Isola is renowned for its homemade pasta dishes. The restaurant’s 
lobster spaghetti and Vitello tonnato are must-try dishes.


Unique Setting

The restaurant’s unique setting, with white tablecloths and soft 
candlelight, makes it a perfect spot for a romantic date night.





St Barths: A Food Lover’s Paradise

St Barths’ vibrant dining scene is a testament to the island’s rich 
cultural heritage and commitment to quality. Each restaurant offers a 
unique dining experience, combining the very best of global cuisines 
with local ingredients and flavors. Whether you’re a food connoisseur or 
just love to eat, St Barths’ restaurants promise an unforgettable culinary 
journey.


Experience the best restaurants in St Barths and indulge in a 
gastronomic adventure that’s as diverse as it is delectable. The island’s 
top eateries offer a blend of international and local cuisines, promising 

https://hauteretreats.com/5-ultimate-kitchens-ocean-view-st-barths/
https://hauteretreats.com/book-perfect-villa-st-barts/


an unforgettable dining experience that will leave you coming back for 
more. So, the next time you’re in St Barths, be sure to reserve a table at 
one of these top eateries and embark on a culinary journey like no 
other. After all, there’s no better way to explore a destination than 
through its food.


Contact Haute Retreats to plan a trip to St Barts our team of expert 
travel designers can recommend the best villas, luxury resorts, 
restaurants and activities for your interests.

https://hauteretreats.com/contact-us/
https://hauteretreats.com/contact-us/
https://hauteretreats.com/contact-us/

